From:  Richard Kahn NN

Subject: GIV
Sent: Tuesday, May 3, 2016 6:32:23 PM
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

FY1 - 3 meredian invoices (monthly, fan air valve swaps and filter replacements) are attached

totaling 22,318.80

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cel

Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Visoski <5l5lGGGGE-

Subject: Fwd: Scan from Meridian Jet Center
Date: May 3, 2016 at 11:38:22 AM EDT

To: Bella Klein HIINENEGN - 2 Pascal
I R ich Kahn E—

For your backup

Amx

Jege LLC

Routine maintenance that Je requested in trouble shooting engine vibration on GIV

Pete will charge to my Amx if that works for you?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: Pete Rawson <

Date: May 3. 2016 at 11:21:07 AM EDT

7o

Subject: FW: Scan from Meridian Jet Center
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Hi Larry,
3 invoices;
The Monthly-
The Fan air valve swaps-
The filter replacements.

Each one has additional minor items.
Give me the OK, and I will run the AmEX.

Regards,
Pete

————— Original Message-----

From: Meridian Jet Center [mailt (i il G

Sent: Tuesday, May 03, 2016 11:13 AM
To: Pete Rawson <N -

Subject: Scan from Meridian Jet Center

Please open the attached document. It was scanned and sent to you from Meridian
Jet Center.

Number of Images: 7
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: Meridian Jet Center
Device Location:
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