
Cc: Brice Gordon Marc Dobei 
From: jeffrey epstein leevacation©gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Red Ixora 
Sent Saturday, November 12 2011 4:16:46 PM 
To: Joseph Igala 

Where is the invoice 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 12, 2011, at 5:07 PM, Joseph Igala wrote: 

Good Morning, 

The Red Ixora, was requested by 
You = Mr.Epstein. 

During a meeting at the Big table with Gary !Cerny, Brice Gordon, Igala Joseph, and 
Yourself Mr. Epstein at the end of October 2011. 

You asked me what would do well there(road to the gym/flagpole pool) besides what 
was planted there before. 

After a few suggestions, you decided on the Red Ixora, "just like What was by the old 
pool" 

So I began the process of Sourcing, and pricing the Material you requested, to complete 
the projects you told 

Me To finish. 

I Have not Purchased anything! 

All I did was arrange an order (sourced and priced the material) based on your directive. 

As usual, I would send the invoice 
For approval, and then proceed with shipping, and instalation. 

I will forward you the invoice for these plants for your review. 

Thank You, 

!gala, Jos h 
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On Nov 12, 2011, at 3:22 AM, Jeffrey Epstein tevacation@zmail.com> wrote: 

on yesterdays call igala said he order axorias for the red thorn road. I 
have repeatedly said , that no new plants were to be ordered and the 
nursery should be emptied. WHO approved the purchase„ Who 
negotaited the prive WHO paid the bill.?? 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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