From: Ljet < -

To: jeevacation@gmail.com; [ GG

Sent: Monday, November 7, 2011 1:32 AM
Subject: Fwd: G-V pics 2
Don,

| was told this GV will sell for 16.5M it needs dual engine overhaul in 500=hours, is there any truth to this? and what do

you think of this aircraft?

I have more photos in next email, Darren is trying to get spec sheet and CN= run,.

thanks,.
Larry

ce; JE

-----Original Message-----

From: Darren Rothell =
To: Larry Visoski r
Sent: Sun, Nov 6, 2011 11:06 am

Subject: Fwd: G-V pics 2

Darren L. Rothell

President

Global Jet Management, Inc.
Helilet Solutions, LLC

Phone IIIINNEGEGE

Fax I

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Larry Morales

Date: November 5, 2011 7:25:50 AM EDT

To: "Alberto F. Baraybar" < ||| -

Subject: G-V pics 2
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Larry Morales
Founder/President
The Skywater Group llc
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