From:  Larry Visoski _

Subject: Re: Fwd:
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2016 4:30:55 PM
To: "ieffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

apples to apples against Avpro plane which we know is 18.750 including inspection,
You were correct,,,Mr Pearlman's 550 is a 16m plane
Sent from my iPhone
On May 30, 2016, at 12:25 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail.com™> wrote:
fiy

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Alireza Ittihadich <

Date: Mon, May 30, 2016 at 12:15 PM
Subject: RE:

G550 5112- RRCC Buy-in $2.262,803.28
GV 512-Buy-in $4,356,099.72 (includes all arrear hours and Family One Premium)

However, RRCC would provide a 10% Discount on the Above Numbers

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@amail.com]
Sent: Monday, May 30, 2016 5:12 PM

To: Alireza Ittihadieh

Subject:

can you get a price from rolls royce, for each of ronalds 550, and 5

please note
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