From: Brice Gordon

Subject: Re: EGP Additional Walls and Steps
Sent: Monday, September 26, 2016 1:06:47 PM
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com=>

Let me resend
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 26, 2016, at 7:01 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail com> wrote:

i dont have access to your google files

On Mon, Sep 26, 2016 at 2:52 PM, Brice Gordon _ wrote:

JetTrey

Attached photos for your review
Additional wall work for EGP has ben completed
Painting of steps will be completed today

Any concerns let me know

DJI_0021.JPG
DJI_0023.JPG
DJI_0025.JPG
DJI_0026.JPG
DJI_0029.JPG
DJI_0032.JPG
DJI_0035.JPG
DJI_0036.JPG
DJI_0037.JPG
DJI_0040.JPG
DJI_0041.JPG

DJl_0042.JPG

EFTA_R1_00033264
EFTA01742548



IMG_4090.JPG
IMG_4091.JPG

IMG_4092.JPG

Stanlev. NM

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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