From: Erad Wechsle_

To: " ' " < ' ' -
Cc:

Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2016 12:28:40 PM

Subject: Re:

I'll ask |db, but that's why | widnt mention "gift tax"...merely "info request” re: grats. Will speak to
leon....b

From: jefirey E. [mailto:jeevacation@amail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2016 08:25 AM

To:
Cc:
Subject: Re:

as this 1s a component of gift tax . and possibly only a begining 1 wouldnt |, but its leons call.

On Wed, May 11, 2016 at 2:19 PM, Brad Wechsler _ wrote:

A couple of questions:

1. leffrey-you saw the format in which we organized the back-up for year one of grat 1 (guite thick/alot
of back-up).

Does that format work (for you and internal use) or do you want it simplified/maodified. Let's discuss,

2. Since this will take the focus and effort of a lot of people (just to pull and organize the various
records...both legal and accting, I'd like to tell the staff that we are answering an "information
request” from the irs on the grats. It will generally be helpful for them to know why the work is impt.

You and leon ok with this?

Will call you to discuss.

From: jeffrey E. [mailto: jeevacation@amail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2016 07:50 AM

To: Brad Wechsler; Melanie Spinella

Subject:

grats 3.4, 5 6, alsoneed accounting documents and backup. vear 2014. other info request
to follow

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereot 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

W imax.com
IMAXE is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation

IMPORTANT NOTIGE = rresseresrsssmrremmramrases

Information contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments is confidential information intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above

Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this comespondence is hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution,
copying

ar communication of the contents of this cormespondence is strictly prohibited. if this e-mail was not addressed o you |, please immediataly
notify us

by phone in Cansda at (908) 403-8500 (collect calls will be accepted) or by ermail at webrmaster@imax com and delete and desiray this

correspondence inadvertently sent to you. Thank you

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

WA Emax com
IMAXE is a registered trademark of IMAX Corporation
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Infarmation contained in this e-mail correspondence and any attachments i3 confidential information intended only for the use of the individual
or enlity named above

Any reader of this message who is not the intended recipient of this cormespondence is heraby notified that any dissamination, distribution,
Copying

ar communication of the contants of this cormespondenca is strictly prohibited. §f this e-mail was not addressad o you , please immediately
nalify us

by phone in Canada at (205) 403-8500 (colleci calis will be accepted) or by email at webmaster@imax_com and delete and destroy this

cormespondence inadvertently sent 1o you, Thank you
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