rrom: [
Subject: Re:

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2016 2:02:59 PM
To: "leffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com:=>

Hi Jeffrey,

[ talked ‘ﬂ."i[h- about her health and she said that she is visiting doctors and taking some
therapies because of ||| GGG s also has snmci
_munti{mud that you asked if she wanted to visit and she 1s really grateful for
your invitation, she would love to come but unfortunately at the moment she needs to get better
and stay at home..

I haven't received anything from Richard and was wondering if he needed some additional
information about the tuttion payment or everything is clear. The payment 15 due tomorrow but 1if
it's a problem I can try contacting the school and ask for couple more days.. | can contact Richard
directly about this if you prefer.

Kisses!!!

On 23 Jan 2016, at 3:42 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

how is [P is she ill?
On Sat, Jan 23, 2016 at 7:36 AM, [ R A

wrolc:

Hi Jeffrey!

Couple of days ago | received a letter from with instructions
about payment of the second semester of the course I'm taking, to be payed by 29
January, 2016.

This time they gave details for making wire transfer payment - I attached the info
to the email.

Hope you are doing well, feeling great and enjoying every single moment! Thank you
immensely for everything!!

Kisses,

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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