Subject: Re: General Il
From: Ann Rodrique
Sent: Friday, May 13, 2016 10:08:28 PM
Cec: Rich Kahn
To: “jeffrey E." <jeevacation@agmail.com>

Hey Bossman,

I had a meeting today with Mr. Hendrington "Bubbler" owner of the General 11

I negotiated a new RT price with Mr. Hendrington of $1,500.00 (original price $3,000 RT). He
said they can start whenever we're ready but first he would like a letter of agreement stating that

we (LSJ or GSJ) would use his vessel "The General 11" for the remaining 2016 year.

Please advise,
Ann R.

On May 10, 2016, at 4:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jcevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

does that mean drop trucks off and then pick up later .

On Tue, May 10, 2016 at 10:43 PM, Ann Rodriquez _vrme:

Yes,
Thursday we will pickup the Canams and Jet Skies.

General 11 would be $3,000 round trip.
Ann R.

On May 10, 2016, at 4:35 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail com> wrote:
did we clear can ams. did we get prices for general 2
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