From: Richard Kahn

Subject: Fwd: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days
Sent: Friday, December 11, 2015 7:52:22 PM
To: "leffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com:=>

it appears based on larry review that Dave overcharged us by 1,000 or 1,500 (157,500 vs 156,500
or 156,000)

should larry or i question him or pass

please advise

thank vou

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Lvjet *
Subject: Re: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days

Date: December 10, 2015 at 5:35:24 PM EST

i've reviewed Daves work days..

On Trip #151 dated 4/2/2015, we flew via airlines MIA - STT, when we arrived in STT, JE canceled the
trip and decided to depart the next moming. This should only be $500 day.

On trip # 168 dated 11/28/2015 this was a Palm Beach departure at 8pm,. JE canceled this trip at Spm
due to bad Weather in STT, we departed the next morning. this should either be No pay, or
$500, since this was a Home departure,

Rich

thix
Larry

=—==0riginal Messag
From: Richard kann ERNNEGG
To: Larry Visoski GG

Sent: Tue, Dec 8, 2015 3:43 pm

Subject: Fwd: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days

please review
Richard Kahn
HERK Associates Inc.
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575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Subject: Dave Rodgers 2015 Work Days
Date: December 8, 2015 at 12:05:16 PM EST

To N

Hi Rich,

Attached are my 2015 work days through December 2, 2015. | would prefer to receive the
payment next month in 2016. Have a happy holiday season!

Dave Rodgers
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