From: Mike Sitrick

To: "leevacation@gmail.com" <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: RE: Follow up

Sent: Monday, April 20, 2015 3:53:03 PM

Jeffrey

You said you would get back to me Friday. I'm assuming you got tied up with
something else, but would appreciate a response.

Thanks

Mike

From: Mike Sitrick
Sent: Wednesday, April 15, 2015 3:30 PM
To: "jeevacation@gmail .com’
Subject: Follow up

Jeffrey:

Here is the information on the outstanding bill:

The Judgment from 08/15/14 was for 5155,464.22

Interest on that judgment, per the judgment (10 percent) through today is 510,051.24

California counsel fees through today in excess of those that were included in the judgment are
535,039.50

California counsel costs through today beyond those that were included in the judgment are 57,862,
Florida counsel costs are approximately $16,000.
If my math is correct, this totals $224,416.96.

| appreciate your calling and apologizing for this situation getting to this point. | too am sorry it got to
where we are.

As | mentioned when we spoke, | believe the fair thing to do is to make me whole for what this has
cost me to pursue. Also, as | mentioned, if we can get this resolved quickly, | am willing to waive the
interest of $10,051.24 which is due according to the judgment, leaving a balance of 5214,365.72.

| look forward to hearing from you soon.

Best,

Mike
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