Subject: Fwd: R

From: >
Sent: Sunday, March 8, 2015 4:39:24 AM
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

This came today from Bruce's producer. Do you have a snappy reply I could give that lets him
know that [ want the full amount for the week (which he said, "don't worry, we'll pay you for the
week" when he told me it was canceled and to go home).

[ cant even believe he 1s asking this. Your thoughts?

Begin forwarded message:

From: Stephen
Date: March 7. 2015 at 3:53:56 PM PST
To: >
Subject: Re: Receipts

Hey,
I'm counting work days Sunday, Monday, Tuesday, Wednesday

$3,500.00 per week
$2,000.00 pro rated
You good with that?

SE

Stephen Eads

On Mar 6, 2015, at 2:23 PM, = wrote:

o
Happy weekend!

On Mar 6, 2015, at 9:32 AM, Stephen

yes, of course
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Stephen Eads

wrote:

If so, would you had me back? o

On Mar 6, 2015, at 7:31 AM, Stephen Eads < wrote:

possible restart on March 23 .
we shall see

Stephen

On Mar 6, 2015, at 10:30 AM, -

wWrote:

Good morning
Stephen,

[ just resent it
S0, has the movie
definitely been
canceled? Anything
clse coming up
soon? | hope you've
been well,

On Mar 6, 2015, at 6:58 AM, Stephen

[nvoice
§ have
been
sent to
accoun
tant.

[ didn't
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see the
54650
0
charge
from
United
for
changi
ng
your
reserva
tion.

Stephen

On Feb 27, 2015, at 6:27 PM, ||| GGG

WIrote:

On Feb 27, 2015, at 7:21 AM, Stephen Eads
<> wrote:

where do 1 send the check?

Stephen Eads

On Feb 26, 2015, at 11:38 PM,

wrote:

Thank you. €
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On Feb 26, 2015, at 6:51 PM,

Stephen Eads <wrote:

I will take care of all of this

Stephen Eads

PM

= Wrote:

Hi Stephen,

These are
yesterday's receipts,
in case you need
them. After
mechanical
malfunction, missed
planes and delays, |
finally made it home
at midnight last
night!

I wish I had gotten
to see you guys.
Please let me know if
you need me to
invoice you for my
week's wages and
per diem or whether
you have that
covered.

Please stay in touch.
Hugs,

<IMG_2168.JPG>

On Feb 26, 2015, at 6:33
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