
Sent: Monday, Februalliaill 
From: Cecile de Jongh 
To: "Jeffrey E." leevacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: DPNR 

Reminder that we need to discuss this bill as the payment is due this month. See below: 
With warm regards, 
Cecile 

On Friday, February 13, 2015 5:24 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation©gmail.com> wrote: 

Discuss tues 

On Friday, February 13, 2015, Cecile de Jongh < > wrote: 

We received a bill from DPNR for the submerged land rental in the amount of $2,500. This is not 
the right amount and I think we should let them know and pay the correct amount. Do you 
agree? 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 
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