Sent: Tuesday, December 23, 2014 5:01:58 PM

Subject: Re:

From: Brice Gordon <} NG
To "ieffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
ok

On Tue, Dec 23, 2014 at 9:57 AM, jeffrey E. <jecvacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

no, idecided not one day thnks

On Tue, Dec 23, 2014 at 12:52 PM, Brice Gordon - wrote:

Jeftrey
Rich indicated that
week we are to release her

uestions

Will she be staying on Ranch, if so Bunkhouse?
What would you like her to do.

Any direction regarding her release.

regards Brice

On Wed, Dec 17, 2014 at 5:27 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

lets speak today please - internet. schedule resume. etc

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereot is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this commumication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

-will be starting with at Zorro on the 29th December and after a
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Brice Gordon
49 Zorro Ranch Rd
Stanley, NM 87056

Ph: (505) 934 2809

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute nside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

Brice Gordon
49 Zorro Ranch Rd
Stanley, NM 87056

Ph: (505) 934 2809
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