From:  "Jeanne Brennan® —
To: <jeevacation@gmail.com=

Subject: FW: Anna's Salary

Sent: Friday, September 26, 2014 3:42:30 PM

leffrey
Should | process Anna's $3000 monthly bonus for Sept?
Jeanne

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2013 1:06 PM
To: leanne Brennan
Subject: Re: Anna's Salary

no, her salary stays the same, 1 will decide on monthly bonuses

On Tue, Nov 19, 2013 at 5:02 PM, Jeanne Brennan - wrote:

Jeffery

Confirming we will transfer Anna's STC salary of (340,000) to LISE and add
it to the $3000 monthly bonus. Her annual salary for LSJE will be $76,000,
effective with the next pay period.

Thanks
Jeanne

Jeanne Brennan Wicbract, CPA

The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged, confidential,
and protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies.
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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