From: Gregory Riches <griches@nyc.rr.com=

Subject: Re:
Sent: Thursday, October 2, 2014 12:44:16 PM
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Will do. s and | are meeting at the apartments on saturday and I've
already spoken to Rich.

Thanks, G

On Oct 2, 2014, at 8:27 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacationf@gmail com> wrote:

please coordinate with karyna and sue . orders tiing and rich kahn will pay.

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

Gregory Riches
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43 West 28th #3
NYC, NY 10001
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