
From: Richard Joslin 
To: jeffrey E. leevacation©gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: trust list for Haber 
Sent Friday, September 5, 2014 4:04:25 AM 

He is signing checks. We spoke today to have Melanie take over. I was going to info Ralph that 
his checking account authority would be changing. I spoke to paralegal who handles foundation 
and we will migrate all accounting and admin to FO. I think if we have FO team with banking 
authority we can pay all bills and Melanie can handle author stipends. I am unsure if Ada papered 
his withdrawal. Will follow up in AM 

On Sep 4, 2014, at 11:06 PM, "Jeffrey E." <jeevacationagmail.coin> wrote: 

did we get ralph off the foundation„ this was supposed to happen months ago 

On Thu, Sep 4, 2014 at 11:01 PM, Richard Joslin cr wrote: 

Eileen: Attached is the trust art inventory for Haber. I can take off the trust 
name if desired. Please print legal. I will send image file that Sotheby's 
provided under separate email. 

The trustee's will get a separate file with more detail. 
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