
From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Karyna School bill 
Sent Tuesday, September 2, 2014 3:26:46 PM 
To: "Jeffrey E." tevacationegmail.com> 

please confirm ok to pay 1,742.00 school bill for karyna 
last paid 35,000 on 6/12/2014 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
fa 
ccl 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn  
Subject: FW: School bill 
Date: September 2, 2014 at 5:53:35 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 

On 9/1/14 9:30 AM, "Karyna Shuliak" wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

There is a balance of $1742,00 on my school bill, that is due by 
September 12th. Would you please pay it. 
Here is the link: 
https://ssol.columbia.cdu/cgi-bin/ssol/6daAEJh0i 1 a3A02bv6NCrB/?p%.5Fr%.5Fi 
d=HtHyYJrvOBUla9ZF12qPfx&p%.5Ft%.5Fid= 1 &tran%.5B 1%.5D%.5Fentry=stu 

dent&tra 
n%.5B1%.5D%.5Ftran%.5Fname=sacl 

My ID: 
Password:

Thank you, 

EFTA_R1_00046219 
EFTA01749497



Karyna. 

EFTA_R1_00046220 
EFTA01749498


