Subject: Re:

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Woednesday, August 8, 2014 8:01:04 PM
To: "jleffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

I just changed - ticket to depart Friday aug 8, flights remain the same as before. If her
departure day needs to change we must do so prior to her departure at 6:45am Warsaw time on
Friday. So | would need to know if this is to be changed prior to 5- 6pm est tomorrow, thurs aug

7 please  Will send ticket once I have it
Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2014, at 3:00 PM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:

Make for Friday but we might have to delay till sat or sun

On Wednesday, August 6, 2014, Lesley Gmﬁ_ wrote:

Just arriving hotel. Will check in and work on this

Sent from my iPhone

_, needs to change her ticket to friday, from thurs, please
confirm
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