
From: Mortimer Zuckerman 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leeyacation@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: 
Sent Thursday, December 19, 2013 6:49:46 PM 

I haven't had a chance to review the agreement yet as I am out of the office but I look forward to 
taking it apart @-) 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation©gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2013 1:48 PM 
To: Mortimer Zuckerman 
Subject: 

had a full hands on meeting with kris and the accts and atmys, lots to do. every step will be 
reviewed and signed off on by both your legal counsel and mine . to give everyone extra 
comfort. cash flow. taxes . trusts charitable pledges, not easy but all doable. I sent over 
an agreement to be signed, I thought to give you cash flow room so that the first payment is 
16 million , I of that to terje and the additional 5 in march, any quesitons . I am around after 
4 
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This message is a private communication and is intended only for the named addressee. it may contain information which is confidential. 
proprietary and/or privileged under applicable law. If you are not the designated recipient. you may not review, copy or distribute this 
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Thank you. 
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