
From: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Epstein carpet job west palm 
Sent: Wednesday, June 25, 2014 4:08:58 PM 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

arc you satisfied with carpet? 
if so please advise if i can pay balance of 16,601.4I 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Epstein carpet job west palm 
Date: June 25, 2014 at 11:55:53 AM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" 

hello rich, 
we completed the carpet installation for mr Epstein last week. 
I wanted to make sure that I can put the balance due of $16601.41 on the same 

credit card that we used for the deposit. 
our book keeper is here today so i will be able to send you an invoice showing a 

paid in full invoice. 
yours sincerely, 

Roger Jones 
Paul's Abbey Carpet & Floor 
Sales Executive 
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