
Sent: Wednesday, November 27. 2013 9:51:01 PM 
From: ann rodriquez 
Subject: Re: ABC Nursery 
To: J <jeevacation©gmail.com> 

Yes Sir. 

Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The Information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and 
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified 
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly 
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender 
immediately and delete all copies. 

From: J leevacanon@gmaii corn> 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Wednesday. November 
Subject: Re: ABC Nursery 

There is nomback up , no invoice. Please never send these requests like this 

Sent from my iPad 

> On Nov 27, 2013, at 5:42 PM, Ann Rodriquez la wrote: 

> Hey Bossman, 

> Do we have permission to pay ABC Nursery the invoice owed $7,350.00? 

> Please advise, 
> Ann R. 
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