
Subject: Re: Mr. Samuel -St. John 
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Monday, November 4, 2013 1:56:32 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 

Will do. 

Ann R. 

On Nov 4, 2013, at 9:55 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no, paint is rdcilours price. tell him 2k 

On Mon, Nov 4, 2013 at 8:54 AM, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Should Daphne proceed with a 50% Deposit to Samson Welding of $10,992.50 for 
(Material & Paint). 

$16,485.00 Dome fabrication 
$5,500.00 Paint job 

$21,985.00 Total amount for project. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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