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Could you forward them to me, please ? 

On Nov 28, 2013, at 11:22 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

forms need to be filled out 

On Thu, Nov 28, 2013 at 6:19 PM, Cc> wrote: 

I didn't fill out any form, but I did start process- i started to collect letters, I sent 
my photos to lawyer as well as list with my modeling history. 
I didn't pay lawyer agency yet, I didn't sign anything so far. 
Why? 

How r u? Where r u ? :) how do you spend thanksgiving? 

HAPPY THANKSGIVIIIIING!!!! :) 

On Nov 28, 2013, at 10:28 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

did you start filling out a visa form with the other agency? 
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