
From: Richard Kahn ‹ > 
Subject: Re: 
Sent Friday, November 1, 2013 4:04:36 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

spoke with zorro pool contracter and was able to lower his bid by 3.5% or 500 from 14,122 to 
13,622 before tax 
job will be completed by end of November 
i will have exact timing of job for you in next few hours 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 

On Oct 31, 2013, at 6:16 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jcevacationagmail.com> wrote: 

did we send wendi the money in fiance. did we engage the pool contractor in zorr 
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