
Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2013 3:09:45 AM 
From: 
Subject: w: nvoice 
To: JE Jail <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Forget it. 
I am beyond disgusted by your behavior. The fact I pay the price for what you did with 
hookers is one thing, being nasty to me after I saved your life is another but it is a 
whole new level when you attempt to undermine and sabotage me behind my back for 
no reason. I don't know what you are thinking... 
I expect you to settle what you promised and owe me as per our agreement, you can 
deduct this from the final amount. 

On Wednesday, November 6, 2013 4:25 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12©gmail.com> wrote: 
Attached is another invoice in the amount of 17,000 that JEE would like you to pay 
Please advise when i will receive checks 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
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