
From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Billy invoices 
Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2013 10:06:52 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Please confirm that per Larry i can pay from JEGE LLC as opposed to Nadia paying via Aviloop 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Billy i 
Date: November 8, 2013 3:00:53 PM EST 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation amail.com>

Outstanding are two invoices I sent to totaling 33,000 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Larry Visoski < > 
Subject: Billy invoices 
Date: November 7, 2013 11:26:19 AM EST 
To: Rich Kahn 

Hi Rich, 
I just met with Billy, he told me that just received his tax bill for his property tax 

and he doesn't want to break a CD to pay this,. can you let me know if 
we can get him his money soon? 

thx,. I didn't mention to JE, unless you think in may help? 

thx 
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tarry 

Sent from my iPad 
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