
From: 
Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2013 3:20 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: JE Jail 
Subject: Re: Invoice 

Hey Rich, <=div> 
I got your mess=ge but there are actually some issue= with the payment I need to discuss with JE so we'll need to hold 
off on a=y checks. 

On Wednesday, November 6, 2013 4:25 PM, Ric=ard Kahn a wrote: 

Attached is =nother invoice in the amount of 17,000 that JEE would like you to pay Please advise when i wrll receive 
checks Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floo=, 
New York New York 10022 
From 
</=pan> 
Subject: <=span>Message from KMBT_C253 

Date: <=pan class="yiv0868940881yui_3_13_0_1_1383717167873_28806" style="font-=amily: Helvetica; font-size: 
medium;">November 6, 2013 2:58:24 PM EST 

<=>ToJ 

Reply-To: 

<=div> 
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