
From: Gold, Steven O> 
Sent: Monday, May 6, 2013 6:26 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: RE: Re: 

Jeffrey, 

Confirmed. The system was=included as part of the scope of work from the Harleysville insurance sett=ement, but the 
settlement has not been finalized yet from my understanding. 

Thanks.=/p> 

Best,</=> 

Steve</=> 

<=p> 

From: Jeffrey =pstein Imailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Thursday, May 02, 2013 3:00 PM 
To: Gold, Steven 
Subject: Re: Re: 

is the brand new system part of an insur=nce claim. ? 

On Thu, May 2, 2013 at 2:48 PM, Gold, Steven wrote: 

Hi Mr. Epstein, 

I wanted to follow up with you regardin= the HVAC at 484 Greenwich. As discovered today, the brand new heating/AC 
system that had been installed in the basement has yet to b= hooked up for AC. The owner was unaware as he has not 
yet needed AC this =eason for the floors which that unit serves (level 1, 2, 3, 4). Moreover, =rior to the replacement, he 
had always used the AC in the summer months and it was fully operational. He s=mply assumed once installed, it would 
be functional — honest mistake= However, please note that he is having it worked on as we speak and it sh=uld not be 
long before it is up and running again and working properly. I apologize for the confusion. 

Additionally, your inspector had checke= the Heating/AC system on the roof which is designed to be hidden (good 
design!), and he confirmed that it is in working order for he=t/AC. That unit serves levels 5 and 6. 
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Please let me know if you have any addi=ional questions. Thanks. 

Best, 
Steve 

From: Gold, Steven 
Sent: Wednesday, May 01, 2013 2:22 PM 
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: RE: Re: 

Hi Mr. Epstein, 

Yes, to the best of my knowledge, the a=r conditioning works fine. There are no issues that I am aware of. 

I just spoke to the owner about more de=ails, as follows: 

There are two HVAC systems for the buil=ing, one on the roof and one in the basement.The one of the roof serves floors 
5 and 6. The one in the basement servers floors 1, 2, 3= and 4. There are thermostats on floors 2 and five, which can be 
set to AC=Off/Heat. You set the temperature and it turns on and off automatically. T=ere is extra electric heat source in 
from of the windows on the 5th Floor and also in front of th= large double height window on the 2nd Fl. There is also 
basebo=rd heating in the basement. Additionally, there is radiant heat flooring i= the lobby and 4th and 6th fl 
bathrooms. 

Any additional questions? Thanks. 

Best, 

Steve 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein Imailto:jeevacation@gm=il.cornj 
Sent: Wednesday, May 01, 2013 8:26 AM 
To: Gold, Steven 
Subject: Re: 

You and I discusses the air conditioning when i visited, &nbs=; we went through looking at the vents. you were 
emphati= re its competence. could you detail for me what the current air conditioning of the building is,? 

On Wed, May 1, 2013 at 2:14 AM, Gold, Steven <steven.gold@elliman.com>=wrote: 

Hi Mr. Epstein, 

To follow up re. Insurance claims: 

"As requested here is an outline with regard to the insurance=claim as we are continuing the settlement 
process: 

1) Our Building Flood Claim by Fire & Restora=ion 171,556.22 

2) Our Building Wind Claim by Fire & Restorat=on 53,509.61 

3) Infinity Elevator Repair Bill 143,683.00<=o:p> 

4) Servpro Bill 10,966.13 

5) CGC Clean up 3,000.00 

6) B & T Electrical 48,427.00 

7) B & T Electrical 5,949.47 

We are negotiating with the insurance company at present we have a= undisputed settlement of 173,432.29 
subject to depreciation and ded=ctible. with the flood adjuster for Harlesyville but this has not been finalized." 

Had the inspection today. Let's get this deal done already! $11mm =s a steal for this property. 

Best, 
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Steve 

steve gold 

vice president 

douglas elliman real estate 

C: 

O 

F: 

<=p> 

<=p> 

<=p> 

Excuse any typos I Sent from my iFone 

On Apr 26, 2013, at 12:32 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation@gmail.com>=wrote: 

could you foward to me any and all insurnance claims made on the h=use, flooding, elevator. structural etc. 
see=yo tues 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-dient privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized 
use, disdosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtojeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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