
From: Mark LLOYD 
Sent: Monday, July 30, 2012 5:26 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: 

Hi Jeffrey, 

I am still awaiting a paym=nt. I have asked your accountant for your bank account details (as y=t not arrived) and will 
wire the funds immediately upon receipt. I apologise for the delay and any inconvenience this may cause you 
administration..&=bsp; 

With best regards,<=div> 

Mark 

 Original Message 
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: wmarklloyd 
Sent: Mon, 23 Jul 2012 19:10 

are you on track to return the loan on the 31st. ? just =ot a call from accounting? 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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