
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, February 10, 2012 6:50 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Re: 

do i have your approval to wire funds in the amount of 80,434.25 for new escalade jojo and i will pick up car monday 
around 12pm please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 646-350.0954 
cell 917-414-7584 

On Feb 9, 2012, at 11:45 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

it would be nice if we could get the escalde and ship the suburabn next week so it is there when I arrive the 
ranch on the 21 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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