
From: Lesley Groff <lesleyjee@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2011 4:02 PM 
To: Jef, Epstein CC 
Subject: 

I did =ot answer 
=ell? 

yesterday re can I reach you...= sent this just =ow...wanted you to see. shall I ignore this as 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
=/div> 
Date: December 28, 2011 =0:54:26 AM EST 

To: "Lesley Groff" <lesley.jee@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: my next =ppointment with Dr.Victor 

Reply-To: 
=/div> 

Dear Lesley, 

I'll =ontact you on 4th Jan. But if Jeff will be back before that time, =lease let me know. 
I think it will be my last 5 month of treatment. =f doctor will not tell me to do 6 as well. 

Thank you again and =ave a good day! 

Sent on the Sprint® Now Network =rom my BlackBerry. 

From: Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> 
Date: Tue, 27 Dec 2011 15:47:49 -0500 
To: =/b>< > 
<=iv>Subject: Re: my next appointment with =r.Victor 

I am afraid Jeffrey will not be =ack until January 4th... 

On Dec 27, =011, at 12:54 PM, < > =lt 
<mailto »...wrote: 

Hi dear Lesley, 

EFTA_R1_00081972 
EFTA01770735



I hope =ou had a great time with your family during the Christmas time and I =ope you enjoyed your trip 
to Florida. 

I need your help =gain. Because on 28th Wed Dec I have my appointment with Dr. Victor for =y accutane 
programme. 

I don't know if you remember I am on =0mg. I need to buy 40mg+20mg , it's about 262$+348$. so, it's 
about =80$ or 700$ with taxes. 

Last time Jeffery gave me 600$. If =e can help me with the same ammount this time. I'll be very happy. 
=/cliv> 

I know it's a Holidays and it's will be very hard to reach =eople but it's how Dr. Victor arranged this 
appointment for me based on =y records in a system for Ipledge programme. 

I hope Bella's =ffice is open Wed. I know a lot of people are working on =ed. 

Please, let me know as soon as you'll have =ny news for me. 

Thank you so much in advance =or everything. 

Happy New =ear 
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