
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Wednesday, April 13, 2016 9:14 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: NIF, Classic Upload Status Change 

please advise if ok to pay balance of 26,250 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Apr 13, 2016, at 4:03 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

 Forwarded message 
From: =b class="> 
Date: =ednesday, 13 April 2016 
Subject: Fwd: NIF, Classic =Upload Status Change 
To: Jeffrey epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Kind regards, 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: * 
Date: 13 April 2016 at 9:32:25 PM GMT+2 
To: 
Subject: NIF, Classic =nbsp; Upload Status Change 
Reply-To: 

EFTA_R1_00089597 
EFTA01775580



After reviewing your Proof of Funding, Berkeley International =ffice has found this document to be 
incomplete for the following =eason: 

Incomplete: Your NW settings have been changed to allow the upload of =our other funds. 

--Please follow the link below to upload additional documents: 
https://io.berkeley.edu/upload/NIFRegular 
Thank you, 
BID Staff 

UploadID: U16510 

=br class=""> 
please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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