
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, Aprilli l lill 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: Fwd: 

Do i =ave your approval to pay Gary March fees in the amount of =4,295.40? 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Gary Kerney" = 

Date: April 5, 2011 1:48:16 PM EDT 

•: .To: "Rich Kahn" <=r> 

Rich 

Where is my march payment?I talked =o Jeffrey Friday and he agreed that I would be paid before the end of =he 
month going forward did he advise you? 

Gary 
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