
From: Jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Sunday, May 3, 2009 7:17 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: LS1 - talk about the project today? 

Yes. Call them tell them that the =ork that wecreceived was iselessv 

Sent from my =Phone 

On May 4, 2009, at 2:26 PM, "Rich Kahn" rote: 

Attached is Bradford's invoice. I wanted to =onfirm that I had the proper invoice that your were referring =o. 

Please confirm that I will pay 4,642.50 (50% of =otal 9285.00) 

Thank you 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein Imailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] =br> Sent: Monday, May 04, 2009 10:10 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: LSJ - talk about the project =oday? 
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pay half of =radfords ball as final. 

 =orwarded messa:e 
From: hasan khan < 
=Date: Mon, May 4, 2009 at 9:50 AM 
Subject: L.S.I - talk about the project today? 
To: Jeffrey epstein «mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Dear Jeffrey: 
Will work on the ground plane. 
I will phone this afternoon to talk about the last drawings we sent =ou for your reactions. 
Would you please process payment to the Bradfords as mentioned =ast week? 
Thanks and regards, 
Hasan 

Date: Sat, 2 May 2009 15:07:00 -0400 
Subject: 
From: <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> jeevacation@gmail.com 

To:

re north elevation we need to build in some landscape so the transittion =rom building to ground is elegant 

<LSJ_Bradford_inv # =.doc> 

2 

EFTA_R1_00098889 
EFTA01780357


