
From: Glenn Dubin 
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2015 4:18 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: RE: FW: Website & PDF 

$ 3mi1 basis, yes on 1031 

Glenn Dubin 

Dubin & Company 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2015 12:12 PM 
To: Glenn Dubin <Glenn.Dubin@dubinandco.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Website & PDF 

is the book value zero? are you going to do a 1031? 

On Tue, Oct 27, 2015 at 11:44 AM, Glenn DubinU 
wrote: 

Glenn Dubin 

EFTA_R1_00101825 
EFTA01782217



From: Amanda D'Cruz 
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2015 11:36 AM 
To: Glenn Dubin 
Subject: Website & PDF 

http://www.avprojets.com/view_aircraft/647/Bombardier_Global%205000%20LE_SN_9206.html 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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