From: wun s S
Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2015 2:

To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Flights
Thank =ou

On Jun 20, 2019, at 9:49 AM, =ichard Kahn <_ wrote:

thanks for updating me with plans

all flights and timing is ok with us..

please let me know if you want me to pay for anything or if =ou prefer to pay and we will reimburse..
thank you =nd looking forward to having you join..

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

! [
cell

On Jun 20, 2019, at 9:44 AM, philip baker <G =t

Good day Mr Kahn,

It's been a while since | talked to you but =yla has been keeping me updated.

| applied for a new passport which | recieved yesterday. My =ld one was still good for a year but |
thought a new one would avoid =ny complications with renewal at a possibly inconvenient time =ater,

| have a flight tentatively reserved which =ould get me into Ft Lauderdale on Saturday, July 5. | would
then stay =and recover) with friends there Sunday July & and was hoping to open a =ank account there (which | have
done there before} on Monday July =. | know for sure | cannot do this in 5t Thomas as | tried at a =revious time.

This would =eave me open to travel to STT July 8. | have not booked anything from =lorida to 5t Thomas
as this would best be done from the =5.

| would have to confirm the flight tomorrow =s it is reserved 24 hours.

| hope this =ooks ok to you.

Regards,
Phil Baker
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