From: Larry Visoski

Sent: Sunday, August 21, 2016 1:27 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: BB) AB-DFR

If memory serves, we painted Gl Silve= to Black at Jet Aviation Paint Shop Palm Beach, the same time we sold
your=White 1963 Corvette convertible to Willis the paint shop manager at let Avi=tion PBI, The official doc would b=in
the Aircraft Log book, which correct owner has possession.

==iv id="AppleMailSignature">

We ma= have invoice record of let Aviation paint shop in NY archives, date 1997 i= a guess, The Gl is parked in Ca=acas
Venezuela now, I'll check if the same pilot is flying it, and try to g=t the log book entry if you like?

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 21, 2016, at 9:08 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com> > wrote:

do you have any record of when we chang=d the g2 from silver to black?

wrote:

Ok got it

Thx

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 21, 2016, at 8:54 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com> >
wrote:

jeevacation is my pri=cipal , he has now left the negotiation and detail to me.=nbsp; please
send all responses to my quesitons thank you, =

On Sun= Aug 21, 2016 at 8:45 AM, Larry Visoski _wmte:

Jeffrey,
Do |=respond to Claire,

"Yes, it's same person, | used |=ad source email address”

EFTA_R1_00104747
EFTA01783795



Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

Erom:=/b> Clire Brugirr

Date: August 2=, 2016 at 8:42:16 AM EDT

To: Larry Visoski I

Subject:

Dear Larry

Are you the same person that has sen= me emails earlier but from another
email ID?

Best Regards,

Claire Bruiirard

From: Larry Visoski

Sent: Sunday, August 21, 2016 16:34
To: Claire Brugirard

Subject: BBJ AG-DFR

Claire,
Thank you for clarifying your Controller ADD.

Could you answer the following questions:

1-15 AG-DFR on M5G-3 Maintenance program?

2-What maintenance facility does the Heavy inspections? (Such as Last C Chec=),
3-When was the Last shop visit / Engine inspection completed on Both Engines=
4-When is the Next scheduled Engine Shop wisit?

5-Could you provide "Read Only" access to the Computerized maintenance
progr=m for me? I'm mainly interested in HPC Disc cycle life remaining.

&-Do you have a Maintenance Budget for the 1C inspection Due in 20177

7- the 4A inspection was due August 08, 2016 where was that inspection
compl=ted? Would it be possible to review that invoice?

8-Are the engines "On Condition” or Hard time overhaul?
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Best Regards,

La rri Visoski

Sent from my iPad

=nbsp; please note

The information contained in th=s communication is

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may<=r>constitute inside information,
and is intended only for

the use of the=addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or c=pying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you
have received this

communication in error, p=ease notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, an=

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all att=chments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The inf=rmation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney=client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended on=y for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthor=zed use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof=is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this

return e-mail or=by e-mail to jee=acation@gmail.com <mailtozjeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies the=eof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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