From: Brice Gordon < >

Sent: Monday, December 5, 2016 12:39 AM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: LS) PRD

Thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 4, 2016, at 8:35 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Ok

On Sun, Dec 4, 2016 at 7:55 PM Brice Gordon _ > wrote:

leffrey

one of the lower end units on PRD has blown

This lower end was a spare part from a blown engine

Requesting approval for two lower ends to be purchased

It is my understanding each unit costs approx 3500 plus shipping with a weeks lead time
One unit is for replacement, other for inventory

As you you are aware the island has 8 x 300 outboards

It will be kept in cost u less

Can we proceed with purchase

Regards

Sent from my iPhone
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