From: Richard Kahn <

Sent: Wednesday, December 7, 2016 4:44 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: additional information from Gagosian

please advise if ok to inspect at warehouse from this =otential buyer before it arrives at foundation or wait until January
=017 thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel =12-971-1306

fax 646-350-0954

cell =17-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>Heather Gray f.:_
Subject: =/b>additional =nformation from Gagosian

Date: =/b=December 7, 2016 at 11:42:42 AM =5T

Hi Rich,

| just spoke with =agosian Gallery. They've confirmed with the Giacometti =oundation that the Foundation is
fine with receiving the work later in =he day tomorrow. The potential buyer is traveling starting this =unday through the
end of December, so tomorrow is apparently the only day that he will be in =aris and could see the work before January.
The purchase price =arry Gagosian has discussed with the buyer is $27.5 million.

Best,

Heather
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Heather Gray

Elysium Management LLC
445 =ark Avenue

Suite =401

New =ork, NY 10022

646-589-0315
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