From: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 20, 2010 4:52 PM
To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: Funding your personal account
Yes

Sorry for all the typo= .Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 20, 2010, at 12:48 PM, "Rich Kahr"_ wrote:

D= | have your permission to fund your account from FTC JP Morgan with 1,000,=00 as the balance in account is
125,738 and | have to pay LS) credit card i= the amount of 181,103. The last time we funded was on 12/8/2010 (see
attac=ed PDF file).

Rich Kahn=/span>
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