Sent: Friday, Dece ) :

To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: STC Charity

our STC required is 50,000 of which we have already =ontributed 33,250 broken down as follows:

10,000 governors summer

5,500 antilles school

15,000 black =erospace professionals
2,500 angel =ommunity

250 harmonic lodge

if we split shall we do =0,000 next week for 2016 and 55,000 in january for 2017

please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor
New =ork, NY 10022

tel

fax

cell

On Dec 9, 2016, at 10:03 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

From stc charity =ueen Louise home 75k ? What is our required amount .might want to =plit 17 . Delivered to

carmen govt house
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