
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Thursday, December 2, 2010 6:00 PM 

Re: S76 urgent update 

Net 115 ok 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 2, 2010, at 12:34 PM, wrote: 

from George: 
Just spoke to the buyer, he has a deposit on a new 76, goes to contract Monday. I think I can get him to buy 750 

at a price of 11.5m, so the JE that is 11,350,000. After commissions to Sam and me. Need to know ASAP to head this 
off, and then there is no guarantee but a shot. Sikorsky is doing year end fire sales Please advise 

George Reenstra 

Aircraft Services Group Inc 
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