
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Tuesday, April 19, 2016 1:24 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: NIF, Classic Upload Status Change 

Is this something we will get involved=with? Arda? Or pass? 
Please advise.&nbs=; 
Thank you. 

Sent from my i=hone 

Begin forwarded message: 

Please speak to JE. 

Thank you, 

Bella<=div> 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date= April 19, 2016 at 7:59:17 AM EDT 
To: bellaklein < 

Do you think i='s possible to produce such a letter for my USA visa approval? 

Thank=you. 

Kind regards, 

On 15 Apr 2016, at 5:20 PM, bellaklein <Are you looking for the completed attached fo=m. Please confirm. 

<Guarrantee of Financial Support for 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span" style="white-space: pre;"> 212-=71-1307 
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<mailt 
On A=r 15 2016, at 11:14 AM, 

> wrote: 

Berkeley University School of Law 

It is required in order to is=ue the NIF form for USA visa for 

<=r class="">On 15 Apr 2016, at 5:11 PM, bellaklein < 
<mailt > wrote: 

Please conform who<=b> requires the letter/proof of funds. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel:=span class="Apple-tab-span" style="white-space: pre;"> 212-=71-1307 

On Apr 15, 2016, at 10:46 AM, 

crnailtc > wr=te: 

Hi Bella, 

=div class="">Thank you for your message. For the moment, they just requir= an 
official letter/proof of funds from the organisation that sponsors the L=M. I need this letter to be able to receive the 
form from the school to app=y for the USA visa. I will have to bring this letter to USA embassy too. 

These are acceptable proofs of funds : 
http://internationaloffice.berkeley.edu/funding_=ocumentation 
<http://i=ternationaloffice.berkeley.edu/funding_documentation> 

Will you be able to get one? 
Within 2 weeks they are supposed to s=nd a link where to pay for tuition. 

cl=ss=""> 

Thank you very much in advance. 

Kind regards, 

<=iv style="margin: Opx; padding: 0px; line-height: 16.8666667938232px;" 

ps :=/div> 

these are the login and password for the futur=: 
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1. Navigate to the Admitted Students Website=at 
http://www.law.berkeley.edu/summeradmit.htm<=span> 

2. login with your Alternate ID" 
3. Enter y=ur Alternate ID and Passphrase, listed here separated by a 

space: &n=sp;llaw-mprusakoval = 8uthaWreCrub 

From: <mailt 
Subject: Fwd: NI=, Classic Upload Status Change 
Date: Fri, 15 Apr 2016 09:42:2= -0400 
CC: =a href="mailt 

class="' 
To: Jr <mailto 

Hi 
I am trying t= make a payment to your school through provided website. Please 

email=your password for the site as i can't reach anybody by phone or email. = 

<mailto 

Thank you, 
Bella 

<mailto 
Tel: 

</=iv> 

 Forwarded message ------_---
From: <= class=""> =/span 

Date: Wednesday, 13 April 2016 
Subject: Fwd: NIF, Classic Upload Status Change 
To: j=ffrey epstein <jeeva=ation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 

Kind reg=rds, 

From: 
Date: n

<mailtr 
u ject= IF, C=assic Upload Status Change 

Reply-To: 
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<mailu 

After reviewing your Proof of Funding, Be=keley International Office has found 
this document to be incomplete for the=following reason: 

Incomplete: Your NIF settings have been cha=ged to allow the upload of your 
other funds. 

--Please follow the link b=low to upload additional documents: 
https://io.berkele=.edu/upload/NIFRegular 

<https://io.ber=eley.edu/upload/NIFRegular> 
Thank you, 
BIO Staff 

pl=ase note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged= may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for<=r class="">the use of 

the addressee. It is the property of 
=EE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
an= may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in e=ror, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-marl to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:je=vacation@gmail.com> ,=and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

<=div> 

=/div> 
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