
From: Alireza Ittihadieh < 
Sent: Friday, November 2I PPPI 
To: jeffrey E 
Subject: Re: 

That is too long. Shouldn't be more than 6/7 months at most. 

$6.0M is what I would have expected as a ROM. 

BR 

Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 
Tel: +1 441 505 10621 Fax: +1 441 292 8666 

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 21 Nov 2014 07:08:46 -0500 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: 

headliner, engineering galley move, etc looks like 6+ mil. and 10 months. 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00122279 
EFTA01791864


