From: Jennie Saunders

Sent: Tuesday, December 21, 2010 2:56 PM
To: Jeevacation@gmail.com
Subject: Fw:

Can we discuss please need ur guidance ...

CORE: Jennie Saunders | Founder & Chairman | |

I . COr eaccess.net |

--—---0riginal Message-----

From: Anna Moine <

To: lennie Saunders

CC: Daniel Rabia

Sent: Tue Dec 21 09:53:09 2010
Subject: RE:

Condo Dues - 52444,96
Mortgage - $3365.77 x 2

Late charges - $567.32 X 2
Escrow- 5979.64

Insurance - 5502.00 (expired on 12/12)

Taxes - $357.70 x 2 (other payment due on 1/1)

Please advise

Be well,

Anna L. Moine
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DANGEME

anna@dangene.com

www.dangen <<image002.jpg>> e.com <http://www.dangene.com/>

From: lennie Saunders [mailto:Jennie Saunders@coreaccess.net|
Sent: Tuesday, December 21, 2010 9:36 AM

To: Anna Moine

Subject:

Tell me amount owed on back mortgage and condo dues pls ..

CORE: Jennie Saunders | Founder & Chairman | _
I | . coreaccess.net |
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