From: svG <

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2013 1:57 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Re: Library gutters

Thank you

Mo one has confirmed payment at this time

Brice Gordon

On Jun 27, 2013, at 7:50 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail. com> > wrote:

yes,, are we straightedn out on cooling tower

Jeffrey

The library gutters need some TLC

J] can do this next Tuesday when he is here to do final punch list work
Cost $435.00

A separate trip to do work will cost $580.00

Can we move forward

Regards Brice

Brice Gordon
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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