
From: jeffrey epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, April 28, 2011 1:14 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: St. Baits balance - Peggy 

No 

Sorry for all the typos .Sent=from my i Phone 

On Apr 28, 2011, at 8:50 AM, Richard Kahn <=a href= 
w=ote: 

Attached is inv=ice for $8,000 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Str=et, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 646-350=0954 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=a href=' 

Date: April 28, 2011 5:35:07 AM EDT 

T=: a <mailt 

Cc: «mailto 

<=pan style="font-family:'Helvetica'; font-size:medium; color:rgba(0, 0, 0,=1);">Subject: St. Bart's 
balance 

Good morning Ri=h, 

I hope this e-mails finds you well! 

EFTA_R1_00130048 
EFTA01795133



I asked in my last e-mail how you wanted me to submit the remaining balance f=om Peggy's St. Bart's 
trip since I know Jeffrey said he would take care of 1.. I went ahead and marked up an invoice for the remaining balance 
and have a=tached it for your convenience. Please let me know if you would like me to m=ny any adjustments. 

Many thanks! 

Deanna M. Romeo 
wa in tail entertainment limited 

900 Broadway, Suite 400 
New York, NY 10003 

750 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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