
From: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2015 3:45 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: ZDC 1994 Bobcat Skid Steer 

Brice wants to sell the 1994 Bobcat for 6000 plus 1,170 of =ost savings on sod purchase at a discount (.53 vs .79 paid last 
=ear) Brice no longer needs this machine as we currently =ave new Case machine 

Brice claims that =achine needs approx 2000 of work which if true would make approx value =f 8000 in line with what i 
see on internet please =dvise if you are ok with selling machine for 6000 and if you want sod =o be replaced outside the 
main house pool area (1,170 is cost savings =n purchase of sod at 2,385 vs 3,555) thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel =12-971-1306 
fax 646-350-0954 
cell =17-414-7584 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: =/b>March 3, 2015 at 12:16:53 PM =ST 

Subject: =/b>Re: ZDC 1994 =obcat Skid Steer 

From: Brice Gordon <zdc.rt41@gmail.com <mailto:zdc.rt41@gmail.com» 

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmailcom> 

Cc: Zorro Ranch <zorro.office@gmail.com> 

Rich 

As discussed the below =iscount is offered by Stone Gate Turf Farm, plus the $6000.00 for the =994 Bobcat skid 
Steer. 

The grass area outside the =ool needs refurbishment, total area measures 90 x 50 = 4500 =q/ft 
Stone Gate is prepared to discount sod price =rom .79 cent per square foot to .53 cents per square foot 
which calculates out to $2385.00 @ .53 for 4500 ft Vs =3555.00 @ .79 for 4500ft, a savings of $1170.00 
Sod =ould be picked up in May 

The bill of sale would reflect the above terms , how do you =ish to proceed. 
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On Wed, =eb 25, 2015 at 2:27 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> wrote: 

ok 

From: BMG <zdc.rt41@gmail.com <mailto:zdc.rt41@gmail.com» 
Date: =ednesday, February 25, 2015 at 4:26 PM 

To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: ZDC 1994 =obcat Skid Steer 

Let's aim for 2.30 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 25, 2015, at 2:16 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> wrote: 

Yes 
How is anytime between 2-4pm =ST 
Thanks 

From: =rice Gordon <zdc.rt41@gmail.com <mailto:zdc.rt41@gmail.com» 
Date: Wednesday, February =5, 2015 at 2:36 PM 
To: Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: ZDC 1994 =obcat Skid Steer 

can we discuss =omorrow 

On Tue, Feb 17, 2015 at 12:14 PM, Brice Gordon =span dir="Itr" class=""><zdc.rt41@gmail.com 
<mailto:zdc.a41@gmail.com» wrote: 

Rich 

Attached for your reference 

Offer from Stone Gate Turfgrass =anch 
Repair Estimate 
Pictures =1 Skid Steer 

Stone Gate Turfgrass Ranch have submitted an offer for the =urchase of the 1994 853 
Bobcat skid steer, hrs 2651 
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Offer: $6000.00 as =s. 

Note: 
There is an oil leak so it =nbsp;will require a new oil pan gasket, at an estimated cost of 

=2133.66 

9k 

Ph: =a href="tel:%28505%29%20934%202809" value="+15059342809" =arget="_blank" 
class="">(505) 934 =809 

Online pricing from machinery trader show =nit similar at a asking price of around 8k to 

Bobcat of ABQ offered 5k with Trade in 2013, =erbal. 

How do =ou wish to proceed, accept offer or advertise locally to see if we can =et more 

please =dvise 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, =M 

Ph: (505) 934 =809 <tel:%28505%29%20934%202809> 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

Brice =ordon 
Stanley, NM 

Ph: (505) 934 =809 

=br class=""> 
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