From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Monday, June 16, 2014 2:47 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Cc: |

Subject: Apt 2 G renovation

Attached are photos of work along with invoice from =nthony Please advise if ok to =ay

On Jun 11, 2014, at 3:39 PM, =nthony Barrett < ||| G <2 G-

>=wrote:
Hi Rich,
Below are the charges for the =enovation of the kitchen in 2G -
Appliances =nhsp; Liebher refrig =nbsp; 53377
= Viking range =nbsp; 56580 =nbsp;
Labor =nbsp: &n=sp; 55000
I=ea Cabinets =nbsp: &n=sp; 56150
Tiles =nbsp; &n=sp; 5985 | =itchen floor)
Counter Top =nbsp; &n=sp; 51650
Faucet =nbsp; &n=sp; 5625
TOTAL =24367
Anthony
=div>

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates =nc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel =12-971-1306

fax
cell
Begin forwarded message:
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eror: N I -

Date: =/b>June 13, 2014 at =:38:44 PM EDT

Tos: =/b>Richard Kann < -

Sent from =y iPhone
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