
From: Jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 19, 2010 10:02 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Claim # 523990 L.SJ, LLC & Jeffrey Epstein 

Thnks 

Sorry for all the typos .S=nt from my iPhone 

On Nov 19, 2010, at 4:32 PM, "Rich Kahn" &l=  &g=; 
wrote: 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc.<=o:p> 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

fa <=o:p> 

cell 

=p class="MsoNormal"> 

From: Johnson, Wardell [mailto: 
Friday, November 19, 2010 4:25 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
C=: Flaherty, Patrick 
Subject: RE: Claim # 523990 L.S.J, LLC &a=p; Jeffrey Epstein 

=o:p> 

Mr. Kahn, 

c=o:p> 

We will be proce=sing this additional payment for the debris removal as agreed. The to=al additional payment is 
$42,460, per the attached letter. 

Please let me know if there are=any questions. 
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W=rdell Johnson 

General Adjuster 

http://www.chartisinsurance.com 
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